
Cairo and Sharm El Sheikh Holiday Package

Price Starting From : $0

8 Days/ 7 Nights
Egypt
Egypt

Located on the southern tip of the Sinai Peninsula, the charming Egyptian city of Sharm El-Sheikh is
renowned for hosting numerous international conferences and diplomatic negotiations. The city and resort

play crucial roles in Egypt's tourism sector.

8-Day Holiday Package to Cairo and Sharm El-Sheikh

Explore the Great Giza Necropolis, dating back to the 4th dynasty of ancient Egyptian kings, during the Old
Kingdom period. Visit the three pyramids of Cheops, Chephren, and Mycerinus, and discover the Egyptian
Museum, home to the largest collection of Egyptian antiquities spread across its two floors. Also, enjoy a

tour of Coptic Cairo before concluding your trip with a 4-night stay in Sharm El-Sheikh, marking the end of
your Egypt Classic Tours.

Overview

 

Inclusion

Cairo Top Tours customer care in Cairo and Sharm El Sheikh airports upon arrival and during departure.

Your accommodation in Cairo Pyramids Hotel is on a bed and breakfast basis for 3 nights.

Your accommodation for 4 nights in Sharm El Sheikh in 5 stars hotel on a bed and breakfast basis.

Entrance tickets to the various museums and sites.

An authorized tour guide during our Egypt Day Tours.

Transportation services by nonsmoking air-conditioned vehicles during all Egypt Travel Packages.

Internal flight tickets from Cairo to Sharm and back to Cairo are included.

All excursions in Cairo and Sharm El Sheikh tours are to be done privately.

Bottle of water and soft drinks during the tours in Cairo and Sharm El-Sheikh.

Snorkeling trip by boat to Ras Mohammed including lunch and snorkeling equipment.

Quad bike desert Safari tour in Sharm.

Stops for snacks upon your request.

Shopping tours in Cairo during Cairo Day Tours. ( if you have time )

https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/best-hotels-to-stay-in-cairo/cairo-pyramids-hotel-giza
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Day-Tours-and-Excursions
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Packages-7
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Day-Tours-and-Excursions/Sharm-El-Sheikh-Day-Tours-and-Sightseeing
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Day-Tours-and-Excursions/Sharm-El-Sheikh-Day-Tours-and-Sightseeing/Quad-Bike-and-Camel-Safari-in-Sharm-El-Sheikh


Taxes and service charges are included within the prices of the 8 Days Cairo and Sharm El Sheikh Holiday
Package.

Exclusion

Any International flight tickets

Visa to enter Egypt. If you can obtain it at Cairo Airport it cost 25 USD

Tipping is not covered by the tour price.

Any optional tours in Sharm El-Sheikh and Cairo during the Egypt Classic Tours.

Entrance to Cheops pyramid from inside.

Tour price doesn't apply during peak seasons like Christmas, New Year, or during Egypt Easter tours.

Itinerary

Day 1: Arrive Cairo, Egypt.

Upon arrival at Cairo International Airport, our representative will meet you inside the terminal to
accompany you to your hotel in Cairo by an air-conditioned vehicle, he will assist you with the check-in
procedures after your 8 Days Cairo and Sharm El Sheikh Holiday Package itinerary will be revised day by
day to assure your satisfaction about the pick-up times and any additional tours in Egypt.

Welcome Drink.

Day 2: Giza Pyramids, Egyptian Museum, Coptic Cairo.

After having your buffet breakfast at the hotel, you will meet your private tour guide to start your tour in
Cairo with the amazing tour of the Giza Pyramids, you will arrive at the famous Giza Necropolis which dates
back to the 4th dynasty of kings and rulers of ancient Egypt, especially during the old kingdom of Egypt
history, you will see the 3 pyramids of Cheops, Chephren, and Mycerinus and move to the panoramic view
area where you can book a terrific camel ride in Giza Pyramids.

 Then you will see the Valley Temple of King Chephren which leads to the Great Sphinx by a passageway at
the end of your Giza Pyramids tour.

We will take the vehicle to Cairo downtown where you will see the famous Tahrir Square and enter the
Egyptian Museum, the biggest collection of Egyptian antiquities is placed on the 2 floors of the museum, you
will see statues, stelae, sarcophagus, and other interesting artifacts among the collection of the golden
pharaoh Tutankhamen during the Egyptian Museum tour.

Transfer now to the area of the Coptic heritage in Cairo known as Coptic Cairo, by the ruins of the Roman
fortress of Babylon, the Hanging Church is built suspended which makes it an architectural wonder, you will
see also the Church of Saint Sergius and the Jewish Synagogue of Ben Ezra before having your tasty lunch in
one of the best quality restaurants of Egyptian cuisine in Cairo and move back to the hotel, if we have enough
time, we can take a quick tour in the Khan El Khalili Bazaar to see the Islamic monuments while having the

https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Packages-7/Easter-Tours-in-Egypt---Egypt-Travel-During-Easter-15
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Cairo-Travel-Guide/Cairo-International-Airport
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Day-Tours-and-Excursions/Cairo-Tours-and-Sightseeing/Tour-to-Giza-Pyramids-and-Egyptian-Museum
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Kings-and-Rulers-of-Egypt
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Kings-and-Rulers-of-Egypt/King-Khufu-Cheops


best walking tour in Cairo.

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch.

Day 3: Fly to Sharm El Sheikh

You will have your daily breakfast at the hotel and then be transferred to Cairo International Airport to catch
your flight heading to Sharm El Sheikh, the beautiful beach tourism city of Egypt, upon arrival at the airport
in Sharm El Sheikh, you will be met and assisted by our representatives to the hotel to check-in and stay the
rest of the day at leisure enjoying the sea and the night show.

 Lunch and dinner buffet meals will be served at the main restaurant in the hotel.

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner

Day 4: Snorkeling to Ras Mohamed By Boat.

Enjoy your breakfast at the hotel then our representatives will take you by car to the dock where you will
board the boat to go to the best snorkeling areas in Sharm El Sheikh, Ras Mohamed Protected Area.

 The snorkeling trips in Sharm El Sheikh are very famous as the Red Sea is one of the most beautiful seas
and introduces the most fabulous underwater life with thousands of species of colorful fish and corals.

 Your lunch will be served aboard the boat and then you will be transferred back to the hotel after enjoying
your snorkeling trip to Ras Mohamed by Boat.

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner.

Day 5: Quad Bike and Camel Safari in Sharm El Sheikh

Today, you will enjoy an amazing experience, the Quad Bike Safari Sharm El Sheikh, our Cairo Top Tours
tour leader will pick up you at the hotel lobby after finishing your breakfast to begin one of the best exciting
Sharm El Sheikh tours. 

After getting a confirmation for your Quad Bike and Camel Safari in Sharm El Sheikh, you can choose
between 2 times Sunrise or Sunset to enjoy the quad biking and riding camels in the Sharm El Sheikh desert.

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner.

Day 6: Free Day at Leisure.



Today is a free day to spend it as you like at the resort, remember that you can try any of our many tours and
excursions from Sharm El Sheikh like the Tiran Island Snorkeling Trip from Sharm El Sheikh or even you
can explore the city of Luxor by a day tour to Luxor by air fr

-om Sharm El Sheikh.

Meals: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner

Day 7: Fly Back to Cairo

You will be transferred to the airport after breakfast, take to the flight back to Cairo, you will be met at Cairo
International Airport to be transferred to the hotel for check-in and have the rest of the day free, or book one
of our amazing Cairo trips.

Meals: Breakfast.

Day 8: Final Departure

At the end of your 8 Days Cairo and Sharm El Sheikh Holiday Package, you will have the last breakfast
included in our services and transfer to the airport for your final departure.

Meals: Breakfast

https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Day-Tours-and-Excursions/Sharm-El-Sheikh-Day-Tours-and-Sightseeing/Snorkling-Trip-to-Tiran-Island-from-Sharm-El-Sheikh
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Day-Tours-and-Excursions/Cairo-Tours-and-Sightseeing

